



Official Bid Tabulation
Bid 17-12, Retaining Wall Blocks

Arrowhead Precast, LLC	Industrial Precast Inc.
------------------------	-------------------------

Section 1: North Shore Granite or Limestone Face

Item	Description	Est Qty	PRICE PER UNIT	EXTENDED PRICE	PRICE PER UNIT	EXTENDED PRICE
1	Full Top Block 28" or 24" Series	100	\$ 66.47	\$ 6,647.00	\$ 85.00	\$ 8,500.00
2	Half Top Block – 28" or 24" series	25	\$ 54.86	\$ 1,371.50	\$ 50.00	\$ 1,250.00
3	Half Middle Block – 28" or 24" Series	25	\$ 54.86	\$ 1,371.50	\$ 50.00	\$ 1,250.00
4	Full Middle Block – 28" or 24" Series	250	\$ 78.80	\$ 19,700.00	\$ 90.00	\$ 22,500.00
5	Full Base Block - 28" or 24" Series	25	\$ 78.80	\$ 1,970.00	\$ 90.00	\$ 2,250.00
6	Full Middle Block - 41" or 39" Series	50	\$ 95.55	\$ 4,777.50	\$ 100.00	\$ 5,000.00
7	Half Middle Block – 41" or 39" Series	10	\$ 42.79	\$ 427.90	\$ 65.00	\$ 650.00
8	Full Base Block – 41" or 39" Series	25	\$ 95.55	\$ 2,388.75	\$ 100.00	\$ 2,500.00
9	Full Middle Block – 60" Series	25	\$ 128.75	\$ 3,218.75	\$ 130.00	\$ 3,250.00
10	Half Middle Block – 60" Series	10	\$ 61.03	\$ 610.30	\$ 80.00	\$ 800.00
11	Full Base Block – 60" Series	10	\$ 128.75	\$ 1,287.50	\$ 130.00	\$ 1,300.00
12	Left Corner Top Block – 24"	10	\$ 77.37	\$ 773.70	\$ 85.00	\$ 850.00
13	Right Corner Top Block – 24"	10	\$ 77.37	\$ 773.70	\$ 85.00	\$ 850.00
14	Full High Cap End Block – 24"	25	\$ 80.06	\$ 2,001.50	\$ 85.00	\$ 2,125.00
15	Full Middle Block 45"	50	\$ 110.37	\$ 5,518.50	No Bid	No Bid
16	Half Middle Block 45"	10	\$ 42.79	\$ 427.90	No Bid	No Bid
17	Full Middle Block 66"	25	\$ 126.73	\$ 3,168.25	No Bid	No Bid
18	Full Middle Block 72"	10	\$ 133.98	\$ 1,339.80	No Bid	No Bid

19	Full Middle Block 78"	10	\$ 147.72	\$ 1,477.20	No Bid	No Bid
20	Full Middle Block 84"	10	\$ 153.93	\$ 1,539.30	No Bid	No Bid
21	Full Base Block 45"	25	\$ 110.37	\$ 2,759.25	No Bid	No Bid
22	Full Base Block 66"	10	\$ 126.73	\$ 1,267.30	No Bid	No Bid
23	Full Base Block 72"	10	\$ 133.98	\$ 1,339.80	No Bid	No Bid
24	Full Base Block 78"	10	\$ 147.72	\$ 1,477.20	No Bid	No Bid
25	Full Base Block 84"	10	\$ 153.93	\$ 1,539.30	No Bid	No Bid
Section 2: Weather Edge or LedgeStone						
26	Full Top Block 28" or 24" Series	100	\$ 66.47	\$ 6,647.00	\$ 90.00	\$ 9,000.00
27	Half Top Block – 28" or 24" series	25	\$ 54.86	\$ 1,371.50	\$ 55.00	\$ 1,375.00
28	Half Middle Block – 28" or 24" Series	25	\$ 54.86	\$ 1,371.50	\$ 55.00	\$ 1,375.00
29	Full Middle Block – 28" or 24" Series	250	\$ 78.80	\$ 19,700.00	\$ 96.00	\$ 24,000.00
30	Full Base Block - 28" or 24" Series	25	\$ 78.80	\$ 1,970.00	\$ 96.00	\$ 2,400.00
31	Full Middle Block - 41" or 39" Series	50	\$ 95.55	\$ 4,777.50	\$ 107.00	\$ 5,350.00
32	Half Middle Block – 41" or 39" Series	10	\$ 42.79	\$ 427.90	\$ 69.00	\$ 690.00
33	Full Base Block – 41" or 39" Series	25	\$ 95.55	\$ 2,388.75	\$ 107.00	\$ 2,675.00
34	Full Middle Block – 60" Series	25	\$ 128.75	\$ 3,218.75	\$ 137.00	\$ 3,425.00
35	Half Middle Block – 60" Series	10	\$ 61.03	\$ 610.30	\$ 86.00	\$ 860.00
36	Full Base Block – 60" Series	10	\$ 128.75	\$ 1,287.50	\$ 137.00	\$ 1,370.00
37	Left Corner Top Block – 24"	10	\$ 77.37	\$ 773.70	\$ 90.00	\$ 900.00
38	Right Corner Top Block – 24"	10	\$ 77.37	\$ 773.70	\$ 90.00	\$ 900.00
39	Full High Cap End Block – 24"	25	\$ 80.06	\$ 2,001.50	\$ 90.00	\$ 2,250.00

40	Full Middle Block 45"	50	\$ 110.37	\$ 5,518.50	No Bid	No Bid
41	Half Middle Block 45"	10	\$ 42.79	\$ 427.90	No Bid	No Bid
42	Full Middle Block 66"	25	\$ 126.73	\$ 3,168.25	No Bid	No Bid
43	Full Middle Block 72"	10	\$ 133.98	\$ 1,339.80	No Bid	No Bid
44	Full Middle Block 78"	10	\$ 147.72	\$ 1,477.20	No Bid	No Bid
45	Full Middle Block 84"	10	\$ 153.93	\$ 1,539.30	No Bid	No Bid
46	Full Base Block 45"	25	\$ 110.37	\$ 2,759.25	No Bid	No Bid
47	Full Base Block 66"	10	\$ 126.73	\$ 1,267.30	No Bid	No Bid
48	Full Base Block 72"	10	\$ 133.98	\$ 1,339.80	No Bid	No Bid
49	Full Base Block 78"	10	\$ 147.72	\$ 1,477.20	No Bid	No Bid
50	Full Base Block 84"	10	\$ 153.93	\$ 1,539.30	No Bid	No Bid
Section 3: Bin Blocks						
51	Full Bin Block – 2' x 2' x 6'	350	\$ 97.50	\$ 34,125.00	\$ 130.00	\$ 45,500.00
52	Half Bin Block – 2' x 2' x 3'	100	\$ 54.50	\$ 5,450.00	\$ 65.00	\$ 6,500.00
TOTAL BID BASED ON ESTIMATES:				\$ 177,921.80		\$ 109,645.00
			Intent to award by line item in various quantities as needed		Intent to award by line item in various quantities as needed	

***Notes Corrected Calculation Error**

***NOTICE: Bid award is contingent upon vendor meeting minimum specifications and formal authorization by City officials.**


A. Rennie, Purchasing Manager


Witness


Date